ORDINANCE NO. 10903
AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND CHATTANOOGA CITY CODE, PART II, SECTIONS 2-349, 2-351, 2-352, 2-354 AND 2-360, BY RAISING TO TEN THOUSAND DOLLARS ($10,000.00) THE AMOUNT OF EXPENDITURES REQUIRED TO MANDATE PUBLIC ADVERTISING AND BIDDING ON PURCHASES AND THE REQUIREMENT OF APPROVAL BY THE CITY COUNCIL, AND TO AMEND CHATTANOOGA CITY CODE, PART II, SECTION 2-353, RELATIVE TO FACTORS CONSIDERED IN ACCEPTING A BID.



WHEREAS, Tennessee Code Annotated, Sections 6-56-306(a) and 12‑3‑1007 provide that competitive bidding is required only if the purchase, lease, or lease-purchase exceeds Ten Thousand Dollars ($10,000.00);

NOW, THEREFORE,



BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF CHATTANOOGA, TENNESSEE:



SECTION 1.  That Chattanooga City Code, Part II, Chapter 2, Sections 2‑349, 2-351, 2-352 and 2-354 be and are hereby amended by striking the words and figure “four thousand dollars ($4,000.00)” wherever the same appear in said Sections and substituting in lieu thereof the words and figure “ten thousand dollars ($10,000.00).”



SECTION 2.  That Chattanooga City Code, Part II, Chapter 2, Section 2‑353 be and is hereby amended by adding new subsections (10) through (13) to read as follows:

(10)
The approach of the bidders to issues raised in the solicitation for bids; 

(11)
The peculiar capabilities of the bidders to perform the contract;

(12)
The proprietary features of the bid; and 

(13)
The overall responsiveness of the bid to the needs of the City.



SECTION 3.  That Chattanooga City Code, Part II, Chapter 2, Section 2‑360 be and is hereby amended by striking the words and figure “one thousand dollars ($1,000.00)” wherever the same appear in said Section and substituting in lieu thereof the words and figure “ten thousand dollars ($10,000.00).”

SECTION 4.  That this Ordinance shall become effective two (2) weeks from and after its passage as provided by law.

PASSED on Third and Final Reading

    September 14                      , 1999.
S/____________________________________






     CHAIRPERSON





APPROVED:_______ DISAPPROVED:______





DATE:      September 15                          , 1999





S/____________________________________








MAYOR

MAM:cjc

1
- Page 2 of 2 -

